
10/13 

EAST BAY MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT 

REQUEST FOR QUOTATION NO. 2404 

CHEMICAL TOILETS, ASSOCIATED PRODUCTS, RENTAL & MAINTENANCE 
 

Bids Received by 1:30 PM on March 6, 2024 
 

 BIDDER 
 

SBE 
(Y/N) 

TOTAL AMOUNT 
BID 

TOTAL AFTER 
APPLICATION OF SBE 

PREFERENCE 

1. American Portables Y 
SCH I – $104,348.40 
SCH II – $104,880.00 
SCH III – NO BID 

SCH I – $92,197.80 
SCH II – $103,964.40 
 

2. Lance Soares Inc. dba Clean Site 
Service Y 

SCH I – $207,540.00 
SCH II – $77,400.00 
SCH III – NO BID 

SCH I – $195,389.40 
SCH II – $76,484.40 
 

3. Foothill Portable Toilets, Inc. Y 
SCH I – $353,024.28 
SCH II – NO BID 
SCH III - $42,120.54 

SCH I – $340,873.68 
 
SCH III – $42,120.54 

4 
. 

Northwest Cascade, Inc. dba 
Honey Bucket N 

SCH I – $221,220.00 
SCH II – $13,080.00 
SCH III – NO BID 

SCH I – $221,220.00 
SCH II – $13,080.00 
 

5. SOS Toilets LLC Y 
SCH I – $82,740.00 
SCH II – $12,720.00 
SCH III – $21,600.00 

SCH I – $70,589.40 
SCH II – $11,804.40 
SCH III – $21,600.00 

6. United Site Services of California, 
Inc. N 

SCH I – $173,580.00 
SCH II – NO BID 
SCH III – NO BID 

SCH I – $173,580.00 
 
 

NOTE: Prices do not include sales tax. 
*SBE – Small Business Enterprise   
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